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City of Omaha AMAHA NEGRASHKA
Jim Suttle, Mayor
April 30, 2013

Honorable President

and Members of the City Council,

Transmitted herewith is a BID TABULATION and a RESOLUTION authorizing the Purchasing
Agent to issue a Purchase Order to Van Diest Supply Company, for golf chemicals, Items #4, #5,
#6, #8, #12, #14, #24, #30, #31, #33, #34, #37, #38, #42, and #45, (description of each item
attached), in the total amount of $96,493.88, to be utilized by the Golf Division of the Parks,
Recreation, and Public Property Department.

The contractor has on file a current Annual Contract Compliance Report Form (CC-1). As is
City policy, the Human Rights & Relations Director will review the contractor to ensure
compliance.

The Parks, Recreation, and Public Property Department recommends the acceptance of the bid
from Van Diest Supply Company in the total amount of $96,493.88 for golf chemicals, being the
best bid received, within the bid specifications, attached hereto and made a part hereof, and
request your consideration and approval of this Resolution.

The Finance Department is authorized to pay for these chemicals from the Golf Operations Fund
No. 21114 and Organization Nos. 115511/Johnny Goodman ($22,480.27) 115512/Benson
($15,507.56), 115513/Elmwood ($28,140.13), 115519/The Knolls ($19,868.66) 115515/Warren
Swigart ($3,365.95), 115517/Spring Lake ($3,765.36), and 115518/Westwood ($3,365.95).

Brook Bench, Ac‘ting Director Date Héman Rights and Relations gD“ate

Parks, Recreation, and
Public Property Department
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Honorable President
and Members of the City Council

Approved as to Funding:

ors QLL@Q 4-19.0

Allen Herink Q\a\ Date
Acting Finance Director %

p:1801tmb

Referred to the City Council for

272% 71905

Mayor’s7 Offite/Title

Date
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CITY OF OMAHA
LEGISLATIVE CHAMBER
Omaha, Nebraska

RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF OMAHA:

WHEREAS, bids were received on March 13, 2013, for golf chemicals to be utilized
by the Golf Division of the Parks, Recreation, and Public Property Department; and,

. WHEREAS, Van Diest Supply Company, submitted the lowest and best bid, within
bid specifications, for Items #4, #5, #6, #8, #12, #14, #24, #30, #31, #33, #34, #37, #38, #42, and
#45 (description of each item attached) in the total amount of $96,493.88; and,

WHEREAS, Van Diest Supply Company has complied with the City's Contract
Compliance Ordinance No. 28885 in relation to Civil Rights - Human Relations; and,

WHEREAS, the Mayor has recommended acceptance of this bid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE
CITY OF OMAHA:

THAT, as recommended by the Mayor, the bid in the total amount of $96,493.88
from Van Diest Supply Company for golf chemicals, ltems #4, #5, #6, #8, #12, #14, #24, #30, #31,
#33, #34, #37, #38, #42, and #45 (description of each item attached) to be utilized by the Golf
Division, being the lowest and best bid received, within the bid specifications, attached hereto and -
made a part hereof, is hereby accepted. The Purchasing Agent is authorized to issue a purchase
order in conformance herewith. Funds in this amount shall be paid from the Golf Operations Fund
No. 21114 and Organization Nos. 115511/Johnny Goodman ($22,480.27, 115512/Benson
(515,507.56), 115513/Elmwood ($28,140.13), 115519/The Knolls ($19,868.66), 115515/Warren
Swigart ($3,365.95), 115517/Spring Lake ($3,765.36), and 115518/Westwood ($3,365.95).

APPROVED ASTO F

Dt bl idp—  4-1-13

ASSISTANT CITY ATTORNEY DATE

p:1802tmb
By e
Councilmember
Adopted......cooiiiei e
USROS Cxty i
APProved........ooooviiiii e



INTER-OFFICE COMMUNICATION

APRIL 4, 2013

TO: Eric Carlson, City Purchasing Agent
FROM: Bob Baber, Golf Manager

SUBJECT: Bid Acceptance, 2013 Golf Chemicals

| recommend we accept low bid from Van Diest Supply on the following items, as per bid specifications.

Item # | - |Description # of Items Bid | $S bid/ unit Total $$
item # 4 | - |Dimension 2EW 70 S 171.34 | $ 11,993.80
Item # 5 | - [Dismiss 34 S 4859 S 1,652.06
tem# | 6 | - [Drives 75DF 6 S 28.69 | S 172.14
Item # 8 | - |Preen Garden Weed Preventer 2 S 20.80 | S 41.60
Item# | 12 | - |Sedgehammer 14 S 56.34 | S 788.76
ltem# | 14 | - |Super Trimec 130 S 63.84 | S 8,299.20
ltem# | 24 | - |Bayleton 50 16 S 42768 | S 6,842.88
Item# | 30 | - |Disarm 480 SC 21 S 259.69 | $ 5,453.49
ltem# | 33 | - |Headway 16 S 417001 $ 6,672.00
ltem # | 42 | - |Actvator 90 15 S 1049 | § 157.35
ltem# | 45 | -| Proxy 80 $ 2224 S 1,779.20

tie 33 Headway 16 $ 41700 | $ 6,672.00

34 Heritage 50 WG 54 S 317.00 | $ 17,118.00
31 Emerald v 1 S 1,40140( S 1,401.40
37 Triton Flo 16 S 637.50 | $ 10,200.00
38 Daconil Action Flowable 250 S 69.00 | § 17,250.00

Note 1: Tie bid on Item#33,#34,#31,#37 and #38 were awarded based on total dollar amount

awarded prior to tie bid, as per Purchasing Department's instruction.

Note 2: Low bid for Van Diest on Item #40 and #41 did not meet bid specifications on a ingredients

VAN DIEST SUPPLY TOTAL COST

P:\~P drive Folder List\Enterprise Operations\Golf\2013\Bids 2013\Bid Acceptance\Bid Acceptance- Chemicals
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X H.H.

L4
. DOUGLAS COUNTY
/(«} REQUEST FOR BID AND BID SHEET
L ON: CITY OF OMAHA Chemicals (Golf, Parks, & Turf)
RETURN BIDS TO: Published: February 27, 2013 Page 1
CITY CLERK
1819 Famam Street BID BOND OR CERTIFIED CHECK REQUIRED IN THE AMOUNT 5%
LC-1 Omaha-Dougias Clvic Center IF THE TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE ITEM OFFERED IS $20,000 OR MORE.
Omaha, Nebraska 68183-0011 BID BOND OR CERTIFIED CHECK SHALL BE MADE PAYABLE TO
"CITY OF OMAHA"
NOT AN ORDER Bid Opening Time & Date: 11:00 am. CST on Wednesday, March 13, 2013
IMPORTANT
1. Bid must be in the office of the CITY CLERK, 1818 Famam Street, LC1, 4. If Federal Excise Tex appies, show amount of same and deduct.
OMAHA-DOUGLAS CIVIC CENTER, Omaha, NE 68183-0011 Exemption certificates wil be fumished. Do not include tax in bid.
by the opening date and time indicated In a sealed envelope marked:
BID ON: CITY OF OMAHA Chemicals (Golf, Parks, & Turf) 5. BID MUST INCLUDE ANY DELIVERY OR SHIPPING CHARGES.

2. As evidence of good faith a bid bond or certified check must be submitted with bid. When submitting bid on items listed, bidder may on a separate sheel, make
Bid bond or certified check shall be made payable o "City of Omaha® suggestions covering reduction in costs wherever this is possibie through
FAILURE TO DG SO IS CAUSE FOR REJECTION. redesign, change of material or ufilization of standard items or quantity change.

3. Rightis reserved to accept or reject any or all bids in their entirety and the bidders shall 71 you do nof bid, retum sheels with reason for deciining. Failure to do so will indicate
have the right to appeal any decision to the City Council. Right is also reserved to your desire to be removed from our mailing lisl. TABULATION SHEETS FOR THE 8IDS
accept or reject any part of your bid unless otherwise indicated by you. SUBMITTED ARE AVAILABLE ON THE DOUGLAS COUNTY WEBSITE AT

www.douglascountypurchasing.org. DO NOT CALL FOR THIS INFORMATION.
Quote your lowest price, best delivery and terms, F.0.B. dellvery point on the Hem(s) lsted below:
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
Chemicals for Golf, Parks and Turf per attached bid
sheets.
[ 70,246 -2
TOTAL OF ITEMS BID: $ {
. (5% Bid Bond is to be based
. "
NOTE: All materials to be produced and labeled “For upon this smount)
( ) Golf Course Use", "For Park Use" or "For Soccer Use".

GOLF DELIVERED TO:
4559 Ames Avenue (24 hour advance notice of delivery)
Call (402)444-4669 -or- (402)669-6164 prior to delivery

PARKS & TURF DELIVERED TO:
8788 Vermnon Avenue (24 hour advance notice of delivery)
Call Bill Anderson at (402)699-1704 prior to delivery.

Questions regarding this bid should be directed to: g
Bob Baber at (402)444-5963 85/ 30

REQUIREMENTS FOR BID BOND: The surety company issuing the bid bond should be licensed by the State of Nebraska and listed on
the current edition of Circular 570 of.the United States Department of the Treasury. A cerlified check, an official bank check, or cashiers
check drawn on a national bank or a bank chartered under the laws of the state, payable to the city, or lawful money of the United States,
or a United States Govemement Bond (negotiable) are acceptable substitutes for bond requirements. COMPANY CHECKS ARE NOT AN
ACCEPTABLE SUBSTITUTE FOR A BID BOND AND WOULD BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF BID.

All bidders awarded a contract in the amount of $5,000 or more must comply with the éontracg Compliance Ordinance gnd have on file with the Human Rights &
'Relations Department the Contract Compllance Report (Form CC-1). This report shall be in effect for 24 months from the date received by the Human Rights &
Relations Department. Any questions regarding the Contract Compliance Ordinance should be directed {othe Human Rights & Relations Department at (402)444-

5055.

RINT LEGIBLY OR TYPE)

Payment Terms NE T%__ 30 / E . .”'HTPPL‘/ [0/’7/3){; [incorporatean: /£
Detivery (o completion) Name: 20 § 5 [/ A MOER G R 1€ VD |signature: =/ Wwﬂﬂ
710 caendar days tiowng | AREA MANAGER |proce: 4109 - 960 -3085[Fac 40)- 4 &6 0994
) award nddress: 4] 7/24) S0, BSTH CIRCLE '

Street/P.O. Box City J/MCoOL A Sime VE Zp (B 326

~

Email Address: R VALVPDER G RIERPY & NER. RE.(Com
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DOUGLAS COUNTY

REQUEST FOR BID
ON: CITY OF OMAHA Chemicals (Golf, Parks, & Turf)

NOT AN ORDER Page 2

DESCRIPTION

Equal Employment Opportunity: In accordance with the Nebraska Fair Employment Practice Act, Neb. Rev. Stat.
§48-1122, the Contractor agrees that neither it nor any of its subcontractors shall discriminate against any employee,
or applicant for employment to be employed in the performance of this Agreement, with respect to hire, tenure,
terms, conditions, or privileges of employment because of the race, color, religion, sex, disability, or national origin
of the employee or applicant.

New Employee Work Eligibility Status (Neb. Rev. Stat. §4-108-114)

The Contractor is required and hereby agrees to use a federal immigration verification system to determine the work:
eligibility status of new employees physically performing services within Douglas County. A federal immigration
verification system means the electronic verification of the work authorization program authorized by the lilegal
Immigration Reform and Immigrant. Responsibility Act of 1996, 8 U.S.C. 1324a, known as the E-Verify Program, or
an equivalent federal program designated by the United States Department of Homeland Security or other federal
agency authorized to verify the work eligibility status of a newly hired employee.

if the Contractor is an individual or sole proprietorship, the following applies:
1. The Contractor must complete the United States Citizenship Attestation Form, available on the
Department of Administrative Services website at www.das state.ne.us .

2. If the Contractor indicates on such attestation form that he or she is a qualified alien, the Contractor
agrees to provide the US Citizenship and Immigration Services documentation required to verify the
Contractor’s lawful presence in the United States using the Systematic Alien Verification for
Entittements (SAVE) Program.

3. The Contractor understands and agrees that lawful presence in the United States is required and the
Contractor may be disqualified or the contract terminated if such lawful presence cannot be verified
as required by Neb. Rev. Stat. § 4-108.

SIGN ALL COPIES fim VAN @/ég’r suprLy (o
By P6<S VANWCERGRIE VD
Title AREA MANAGEE

CONTINUATION SHEET




Responsible Contractor Compliance Form
RC-1

~
<

=l

E

Repulation:
A. Article 1V, Division I of Chapter 10 of the Omaha Municipal Code thereon require:.

1. That all contractors who submit-a bid to City of Omaha shall designate a representative who on
behalf of the Contractor, shall fill out completely a Responsible Contractor Compliance Form
(RC-1). An incomplete or unsigned RC-1 form will make your bid null and void.

Filing this Report (please initial in the boxes below):

Contractor agrees that Contractor will not knowingly employ or hire an employee not lawfully

-authorized to perform employment in the United States and that the Contractor and all sub-

contractors shall use E-Verify to determine work eligibility.

Contractor agrees that Contractor will not knowingly violate Nebraska's Misclassification of
Employee law (Neb. Rev. Stat, Section 48-2901 et seq.).

Contractor agrees that Contractor will not knowingly violate Nebraska’s Fair Labor Standards
Law (Neb. Reyv. Stat. Section 73-104 et seq.).

Contractor has not been convicted of any tax violations (local, State and Federal) within the last
three years from the date this bid is submitted.

" Contractor has not, upon final determination by the Occupational Safety and Health

Administration, been convicted of a criminal, repeat, or willful viclation of the Occupational
Safety and Health Act (OSHA) or been convicted of 3 (three) separate “serious” OSHA violations
within the past three (3) years.

Contractor agrees to make a good faith effort to ensure all subcontractors employed on this project
comply with the provisions of the Responsible Contractor Compliance Form RC-1.

@J/\(/&bﬁ/ﬁﬁ | Dii/u/!é

Signature

By signing, 1 verify on behalf of the Contractor that the information above is true and correct. Filing false
information carries a penalty of up to a $500 fine or six months in jail. In addition, the contractor and sub-
contractors can be subject to immediate disqualification and prohibited from any future City of Omaha
contract for a period of 10 years.
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Chemicals-Herbicides

Quantity Description Unit Price | Extended Price
' Acclaim Extra (Fenoxaprop-p-ethyl 6.59% or equivalent) ) )
" lax1gal ()34, 76| 20 43.32
Algae X (Copper sulfate 19.8% or equivalent) -
1 x 4 gal p/case /2 A5
Bensumec 4 Lf (Bensulide 46% or equivalent) » . -
15 2 x 1 gal p/case 97 . 59| 13868 85
Dimension 2EW (Dithiopyr 24% or equivalent) 5
0 l2x2s gal. p/case )7/ 34| 993 - 50
Dismiss (Sulfentrazone 39.6% or equivalent) _
3 160z H8.49| 1bs2 .06
Drives 75 DF (Quinclorac 75% or equivalent)
6 lex1 26,69 | 172.14
Penduium 3.3 EC (Pendimethalin 37.4% or equivalent) _
O |5x25galicase 25.64
2 Preen Garden Weed Preventer (Trifluralin 1.47% 31.3 b
Bag or equivalent) 40 Ib. bag 20 %0 e /. 60
33 Quicksilver T & O (Carfentrazone-ethyl 21.3% or )
equivalent) 8 oz bottle 100.24| 3307.92-
40 Ronstar G (Oxadiazon 2.0% or equivalent)
50 Ib bags 57.00 228000
Roundup Pro (Glypohsate 41% or equivalent) .
30 2 x 2.5 gal/case (345 H03.50
Sedgehammer (Halosulfuron Pro 75% or equivalent) . -
14 1.3 0z. box 5[7,—34 76% .76
Sonar AS (Fluridone 41.7% or equivalent)
0 {32 oz bottle 697.09 B
Super Trimec ( 2,4-5 (32.45%) + 2,4-DP (15.9%) + Dicamba
130 (5.38%) or equivalent) 2 x 2.5 gal 63.84 | €299 . 20
Tordon RTU (Picloram 5.4% + 2,4-D 20.9% or equivalent) 1 .
6 | 424t .29 Hob YL
Triamine Jet-Spray Spot Weed Killer (or equivalent)
36 22 ounce Aerosol Cans 1’/ 6/ /65 96
Speed Zone Carfentrazone-ethyl62%+2,4-D,2-ethylhexyl
45 |ester 28.57%+Mecoprop-p Acid 5.88% Kicamba acid 5’8 69 264706

63.22% Or Equivalent

Deliver to Fontenelie Maintenance Yard
4559 Ames Ave, 68104
***A 48 hour notice of delivery is mandatory before any
shipments will be accepted. Please contact Robert

Baber, (402) 444.5953, City of Omaha Golf Manager, 48
hours before any deliveries are anticipated.
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Chemicals- Insecticides

Quantity | " 7 -Degerption: . Unit Price | Extended Price
_ Acelepryn (Chlorantramll role 18.4% or .
equivalent) 8-ez. bottle (64 02) %971.50
Aloft GC SC (Clothianidin + Bifenthrin or _
7 equivalent) 64 oz. container H 8 q.00 3 42 3. -
__ |Dylox 6.2G (Trichlorfon 6.2% or equivalent)
30 Ib. bag 277.60
Merit 75 WSP (Imidacloprid or equivalent) . .
34 4 x 4 x 1.6 oz packet/case 93-93!71 3/4/9-87

Deliver to Fontenelle Maintenance Yard
4559 Ames Ave, 68104

before any shipments will be accepted.

Please contact Robert Baber, {402)
444.5953, City. of Omaha Golf Manager, 48

***A 48 hour notice of delivery is mandatory

hours before any deliveries are anticipated.
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Protection

Quantity Description _ Unit Price | Extended Price
' Banner Maxx (Propiconazole 14.3% or equivalent)
0 |2 x2.5 gal p/case 69.97 -
10 Banol (Propamocarb hydrochloride 66.5% or .
equivalent) 2 x 1 galicase 271.97| 271270
16 Bayleton 50 (Tridimefon 50% or equivalent)
4 x4 x 5.5 oz p/case HA6B| 6B42.8%
Chipco Aliette Signature (Fosetyle AL 80% No )
187 Substitutions) 4 x 5.5 Ib per case Q | )4 37 5318
Chipco 26018 FLO (lprodione 23.3% or equivalent) .
145 |25 gal. per case 46 .14 | 5820. 30
Cleary 26/36 (lprodione 19.65% + Thiphanate-methyl .
14 19.65% or equivalent) 2 x 1 gal. p/case ), 7. 35/ )9‘3'9* %
Cleary 33/36 F (Thiphanate-methyl 16.65% or . -
80 equivalent) 2 x 2.5 gal p/case 5 [0 | 408720
Daconil Weather Stik (Chlorothalonil 54% or , .
305 equivalent) 2 x 2.5 gal. p/case ;2 5. 5? 7/ 80 ‘7'- 95
Disarm 480 SC (Fluoxastrobin 40.3% or equivalent)
21 4 x 16 oz (1 Pint) p/case «qu' 67 51”,53-4?
Emerald (Boscalid 70% or equivalent)
! BASF 10 x .49lb 14061 Ho| 1401 40
Fore 80 WP Rainshield (Mancozeb 80% or equivalent) ) -
8 x 6 Ib p/case é L/
16 Headway (Azoxystrobin 5.73% + Propiconazole 9.54%
or equivalent) 4 x 1 gal p/case 417,60 667:2.00
Heritage 50 WG (Azonxystrobin 50% or equivalent)
% lax6b.-24 Ib. pack S/7.00[ )17118.00
Spectator (Propiconazole 41.8% or equivalent)
55 2 x 2 gal p/case 155, 74 8576.70
0 Terraneb SP (Chloroneb 65% or equivalent)
12 x 3 Ib/case B ~
Triton Flo (Triticonazole 30.1% Or Equivalent) . .
Daconil Action Flowable 53.94zchlorothalonil
250 " 1117.ACIBRENZOLAR NO Substitutions 2x2.5gal | 67:00 | /7250.00
TORQUE Tebuconazole 38.773.6lbs’
15 TEBUCONAZOLE per gal or Equivalent $20 Q71| / 9 1. 5%
2x2.5gal/case
Iprodione 23.3%+ETQ Turf Protection Or Equivalent |
15 2x2.5Gal “40. /q 609' 10
0,
10 Echo Dyad ETQ Chiorothalonil 38.5%+/eto Turf 94,99 2 5,70

Deliver to Fontenelle Maintenance Yard
4559 Ames Ave, 68104
***A 48 hour notice of delivery is mandatory before
any shipments will be accepted. Please contact
Robert Baber, (402) 444.5953, City of Omaha Golf

Manager, 48 hours before any deliveries are

/
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Chemicals - Others

Quantityl . . - ..~ Description Unit Price | Extended Price
Activator 90 (Non-lonic Surfactant or equivalent) ' -
15 12x25gal /049 | /57 35
1975 Cascade Plus (Surfactant No Substitutions) _
™~ 12 x2:5 gal. p/case NO BID |
Primo Maxx (Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3% or _
4 equivalent) 2 x 2.5 gal p/case 129.97 519.6%
Proxy (Ethephone 21.7% or equivalent) , : ,
80 2 x2.5 gal. per case 99.9('/ [ 779. 20
Recede Defoamer (Or equivalent) .
2 12 x 16 oz picase _ 58-68 / (7.36
Talpirid Mole Bait (Bromethalin .025% or
equivalent) 1 Box/20 Worms: 2).47 -
Lesco Sol Spray Tank Cleaner (Or equivalent)
9‘( 2 Ib containers 3H copiavERrS P |3.97 /# F73.93
Conduit 90 (Alkoxylated Polyols 99% No
= po BID —

Substitutions) 2 x 2.5 gal (liquid)

Deliver to Fontenelle Maintenance Yard
4559 Ames Ave, 68104

***A 48 hour notice of delivery is mandatory

before any shipments will be accepted. Please

contact Robert Baber, (402) 444.5953, City of

Omaha Golf Manager, 48 hours before any
deliveries are anticipated.




2013 PARK MAINTENANCE CHEMICALS

January 28, 2013 REQUEST FOR BID
QUANTITY | DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
200 gal Round-up Pro (Monsanto) A 6 vm . OO
2 x 2.5 gal. per case / 5 9 é qo -
500 gal 2-4D w/ Dicamba ) .00
2 x 2.5 gal per case /qoq 9417/5/
200 Gal ‘Pendulum . oo
2 X 2.5 gal per case 25 .64 | 5108 —
40 Gal Reward - aquatic . :
q 76.59 |3663,60
| 20 Gal Garlon 3 :
t\) 2 x 2.5 gal per cas L/7 OL% 940,80

Note: No Substitutes.

Note: REQUIREMENT FOR BID BOND
*Total of items bid will determine bid bond
amount due.

Deliver to 8788 VERNON Ave.

24 HOUR ADVANCE NOTICE OF DELIVERY IS
REQUIRED. Please contact Bill Anderson at 699-1704
prior to delivery.

SASPECIFICATIONS\2013\Chemicals (G.P.T.).2.DOC
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2013 SPORTS TURF CHEMICALS

January 28, 2013 REQUEST FOR BID
QUANTITY | DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
15 gal Round up Pro Bid/gallon

2 x 2.5 gal. per case /_?) y = O’)Ol )5
15 gal Pendulum Bid/gallon .

2x.2.5 gal per case 9 54 (/)L/ 381-/ 60
7 Gal Banol Bid/gallon ;"7 | . q7 /9037(?
4 pints Dismiss Bid/pint HE.S 7 194 34

Note: No Substitutes.

Note: REQUIREMENT FOR BID BOND
*Total of items bid will determine bid bond
amount due.

Deliver to 8788 VERNON Ave.

24 HOUR ADVANCE NOTICE OF DELIVERY IS
REQUIRED. Please contact Bill Anderson at 699-

1704 prior to delivery.

TOoTAL BiO e
[70, 246 . 02

S:ASPECIFICATIONS\2013\Chemicals (G.P.T.).2.DOC
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GOLF CHEMICALS

ACCLAIM EXTRA
ALGAE X
BENSUMEC 4LF
DIMENSION 2EW
DISMISS

DRIVE 75 DF

PENDULUM 3.3 EC
PREEN WEED PREVENTER ( TRAMMEL 5% )

QUICKSHLVER T&O
RONSTAR G

(SEPRO SECLEAR)

ROUNDUP PRO (BUCCANEER PLUS 41% GLYPHOSATE)

SEDGEHAMMER
SONAR AS
SUPER TRIMEC
TORDON RTU
TRIAMINE
SPEEDZONE
ACELEPRYN
ALOFT GCSC
DYLOX 6.2

MERIT ( ZENITH 75 WSP IMIDACLOPRID - 4X4X1.60Z/CASE )

BANNER MAXX (FATHOM 14.3% )

BANOL
BAYLETON 50

(4X4X5.5 OZ / CASE)

CHIPCO ALLIETTE SIGNATURE

CHIPCO 26019
CLEARY 26/36

CLEARY 3336 ( TRANSOM 16.65% THIOPHANATE-METHYL)

(2X2.5G / CASE)

$4.86/0Z=

DACONIL WS ( MAINSAIL 6F 54% CHLOROTHALONIL)

DISARM 480 SC

EMERALD (10X .49 #/CASE)

FORE WSP
HEADWAY
HERITAGE 50 WG

SPECTATOR ( COLONY 41.8 % PROPICONAZOLE )

UNIT PRICE

$434.76 / GAL
$12.15/GAL
$92.59 / GAL
$171.34 / GAL
$48.59/PT
$2869/#
$25.64 / GAL
$20.80 / 40# BAG
$100.24 / BTL
$57.00/ BAG
$13.45/ GAL

$ 56.34 / BOX
$697.09/QT
$63.84 / GAL
$11.29/QT
$4.61/2202Z
$58.69 / GAL
$897.50/ 64 0Z
$ 489.00 /64 OZ
$ 27.60 / BAG
$63.232 / CASE
$69.97 / GAL
$271.97 / GAL
$427.68 / CASE
$21.14/ #
$40.14 / GAL
$87.34/ GAL
$51.09 / GAL
$25.59 / GAL
$259.69 / PINT
$1401.40 / CASE
$6.14/#
$417.00 / GAL
$317.00/ #
$155.94 / GAL
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TERRANEB SP

TRITON FLO

DACONIL ACTION

TORQUE ( TEBUCONAZOLE 38.773 )

IPRODIONE 23.3%

CHLOROTHALONIL 500 ZN

ACTIVATOR 90

CASCADE PLUS

PRIMO MAXX ( T-NEX TRINEXAPEC-ETHYL 11.3 %)
PROXY ( ETHEPHON 2SL, 21.7 % ETHEPHONE )
DEFOAMER (12X 16 OZ / CASE) $4.89/PINT
TALPIRID

TANK CLEANER ( 6X3 # / CASE ) 3# CONTAINER
CONDUIT 90

PARK CHEMICALS

ROUNDUP PRO (BUCCANEER PLUS 41% GLYPHOSATE )
2 -4 D W/DICAMBA

PENDULUM 3.3 EC

REWARD

GARLON 3A ( ELEMENT 3A)

SPORTS TURF CHEMICALS

ROUNDUP PRO ( BUCCANEER PLUS 41 % GLYPHOSATE )
PENDULUM 3.3 EC

BANOL

DISMISS

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED BY,

ROSS VANDERGRIEND @ VAN DIEST SUPPLY COMPANY
(402) 960-3055

THANK YOU ! Q

NO BID
$637.50 / GAL
$69.00 / GAL
$80.97 / GAL
$40.14 / GAL
$24.97 / GAL
$10.49 / GAL
NO BID
$129.97 / GAL
$22.24 / GAL
$ 58.68 / CASE
$31.47 / BOX
$3.97/#

NO BID

$13.45 /GAL
$19.09 / GAL
$25.64 /GAL
$76.59 /GAL
$47.04 / GAL

$13.45/ GAL
$25.64 / GAL
$271.97 / GAL
$48.59 / PINT




